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PRIZE DRAW TERMS & CONDITIONS 

 

1. The prize draw is open to all persons aged 18 years or over (proof of age might be requested), except employees 
of CACI, their families, agents or any third party directly associated with administration of the prize draw. 

2. The prize draw is free to enter and no purchase is necessary. 

3. All entries must be submitted via the Laracon India landing page on caci.co.uk and only one entry per person is 
permitted. 

4. The opening date for entries is 6:30pm GMT on 22nd March 2024. The closing date of the prize draw is 6:29pm 
GMT on 23rd March 2024.  Entries received after this time will not be considered. 

5. CACI accepts no responsibility for entries not successfully completed due to a technical fault of any kind any 
incomplete entries will not be considered valid for entry into the prize draw. CACI accepts no responsibility for 
any entries which are not completed for any reason. 

6. A winner will be chosen by random draw performed by a computer process before 30th April 2024 ("Draw Date"). 

7. The 3 selected winners will receive one of the following items of their choice 

• Up to 30-minute on a remote call with one of our Manager to discuss career option and informal 
coaching;  

• Up to 30-minute on a remote call with our Recruitment Team to perform a “mock” job interview;  

• Up to 30-minute on a remote call with one of our Technical Lead for a code review session; 

• Up to 30-minute on a remote call with one of our Product Manager to advise on product launch. 
 

8. The winners will be notified by email (using details provided at entry) before 30th June 2024. If a winner does 
not respond to CACI within 14 days of being notified by CACI, then the winner's prize will be forfeited and CACI 
will be entitled to select another winner at random in accordance with the process described above. 

9. The prizes will be delivered remotely and digitally via calls on MS Teams to the winners within a suitable period 
pre-agreed by both parties but within 90 days of being notified of their win. 

10. The prize for the winner is subject to availability, non-exchangeable, non-transferable and no cash alternative is 
offered.  

11. CACI reserves the right to replace the prize with an alternative prize of equal or lower value if circumstances 
beyond CACI's control makes it necessary to do so.  

12. The decision of CACI regarding any aspect of the prize draw is final and binding and no correspondence will be 
entered into about it.  

13. Participants are deemed to have accepted and agreed to be bound by these terms and conditions upon entry 
(which are subject to change from time to time). CACI reserves the right to refuse entry, or refuse to award the 
prize to anyone in breach of these terms and conditions.  

14. CACI reserves the right to hold void, cancel, suspend, or amend the promotion where it becomes necessary to 
do so. 

15. Except as excluded by law, CACI shall have no liability for any loss and/or damage occurring as a result of entering 
into the prize draw or taking up the prize. Your statutory rights are not affected. 

16.  Winners may be required to participate in publicity related to the prize draw which may include the publication 
of their first name and photograph in any media. 

17. Personal data supplied during the course of this promotion will be treated according to CACI Privacy Policy 
available on https://www.caci.co.uk/data-privacy/   

18. The prize draw will be governed by English law and entrants to the prize draw submit to the jurisdiction of the 
English courts. 

19. The prize draw has been organised by CACI Limited (company number 01649776) of CACI House, Kensington 
Village, Avonmore Road, London, W14 8TS. 
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